
ESM Solutions - Sourcing - Line Item Bid

Event ID B20010

Event Name Vehicle Rental

Section Name Standard Line Item Pricing

Section Attachments

Supplier Name  Response Notes  Response Attachment Item/Service (Required - 

Entity)

Vans (Required - 

Supplier)

Mini-Vans 

(Required - 

Supplier)

Mid-Size Vehicles 

(Required - 

Supplier)

Large-Size 

Vehicles 

(Required - 

Supplier)

Notes  SupplierNotes Attachme

nts

NoBid

Enterprise Holdings Thank you again for the opportunity to 

earn your business again and we 

appreciate the partnership through the 

years. The Certification is attached in a 

few spots to ensure you received that as 

well.  Let me know if you need any 

additional information and have a great 

day!  - Eric Klix

 Certification of Contract 

Bidder

Quote the charge, if any, 

for a driver under the 

age of 25 for each 

vehicle

None None None None Like in the past, I have received 

approval from our corporate office to 

allow 21+ driver on 12/15 passenger 

vans, sedans, and minivans. Due to 

liability aspects of renting 12/15 

passenger vans there are a couple 

items that would be required for us to 

allow this: 

o	We would need a COI showing a 

minimum of 3 million dollars in auto & 

general liability coverage listing 

Enterprise as an additional insured.  

We must maintain this COI current at 

all times.  Enterprise would be listed as 

“Enterprise Leasing Company of 

Chicago, LLC”

o	The drivers must be 21 years of age 

or older.  I noticed it said 18+ drivers 

may move the vans but unfortunately 

this would not be allowed.

o	All drivers/renters must sign the 15 

passenger van addendum.

o	We would have a restriction that the 

vans are not allowed out of the 

country

No

Enterprise Holdings Thank you again for the opportunity to 

earn your business again and we 

appreciate the partnership through the 

years. The Certification is attached in a 

few spots to ensure you received that as 

well.  Let me know if you need any 

additional information and have a great 

day!  - Eric Klix

 Certification of Contract 

Bidder

Quote the cost per mile 

over the free miles 

allowed for each vehicle

N/A N/A N/A N/A No

Enterprise Holdings Thank you again for the opportunity to 

earn your business again and we 

appreciate the partnership through the 

years. The Certification is attached in a 

few spots to ensure you received that as 

well.  Let me know if you need any 

additional information and have a great 

day!  - Eric Klix

 Certification of Contract 

Bidder

Quote the daily rental 

cost for each vehicle 

type

74.50 58.50 35.00 38.00 Large Size Car is Fullsize being quoted 

like in the past

No

Enterprise Holdings Thank you again for the opportunity to 

earn your business again and we 

appreciate the partnership through the 

years. The Certification is attached in a 

few spots to ensure you received that as 

well.  Let me know if you need any 

additional information and have a great 

day!  - Eric Klix

 Certification of Contract 

Bidder

Quote the daily rental 

cost for each vehicle 

type for the 2nd year 

renewal

74.50 58.50 35.00 38.00 No

Enterprise Holdings Thank you again for the opportunity to 

earn your business again and we 

appreciate the partnership through the 

years. The Certification is attached in a 

few spots to ensure you received that as 

well.  Let me know if you need any 

additional information and have a great 

day!  - Eric Klix

 Certification of Contract 

Bidder

Quote the daily rental 

cost for each vehicle 

type for the 3rd year 

renewal

74.50 58.50 35.00 38.00 No

Enterprise Holdings Thank you again for the opportunity to 

earn your business again and we 

appreciate the partnership through the 

years. The Certification is attached in a 

few spots to ensure you received that as 

well.  Let me know if you need any 

additional information and have a great 

day!  - Eric Klix

 Certification of Contract 

Bidder

Quote the number of 

free miles per day for 

each vehicle type

Unlimited Unlimited Unlimited Unlimited No

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Corporation

Confirmed.  Cert of Bidder Quote the charge, if any, 

for a driver under the 

age of 25 for each 

vehicle

N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Corporation

Confirmed.  Cert of Bidder Quote the cost per mile 

over the free miles 

allowed for each vehicle

.15 per mil No Bid No Bid No Bid No

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Corporation

Confirmed.  Cert of Bidder Quote the daily rental 

cost for each vehicle 

type

128 No Bid No Bid No Bid $150 EW per vehicle. Refuel cost is 

$6.99 per gallon

No

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Corporation

Confirmed.  Cert of Bidder Quote the daily rental 

cost for each vehicle 

type for the 2nd year 

renewal

132 No Bid No Bid No Bid $150 EW per vehicle. Refuel cost is 

$6.99 per gallon

No

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Corporation

Confirmed.  Cert of Bidder Quote the daily rental 

cost for each vehicle 

type for the 3rd year 

renewal

136 No Bid No Bid No Bid $150 EW per vehicle. Refuel cost is 

$6.99 per gallon

No

Hertz Equipment Rental 

Corporation

Confirmed.  Cert of Bidder Quote the number of 

free miles per day for 

each vehicle type

0 per day, 400 per 

week, 1200 per 

month

No Bid No Bid No Bid $150 EW per vehicle. Refuel cost is 

$6.99 per gallon

No


